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Neil Bruce, 45, is the Chief Operating Officer of AMEC plc – Natural Resources. 
 
Neil joined AMEC in 1997 and after two years of consistent progress, Neil was appointed 
Managing Director of AMEC’s Upstream Oil & Gas division, in October 1999. In October 
2003, a single Oil and Gas division was created combining the Upstream and Downstream 
global divisions, and Neil was appointed Managing Director. In May 2006, AMEC created 
an expanded Natural Resources division which covers AMEC’s global activities in oil and 
gas, oil sands and mining. Natural Resources division accounts for over fifty percent of the 
operating profits of AMEC’s Energy and Process business.  
 
AMEC plc is a leading international provider of total life-of-asset services to customers with 
revenues of £5 billion. The Natural Resources division provides two main services in the 
energy and process industries: asset development and asset support services for the 
development of oil, gas and mining facilities. 
 
These services are underpinned by specialist technology services, which provide high 
value technical services such as environmental and training geared to support local 
requirements. 
 
Neil is a Chartered Engineer and has a Masters Degree both from Newcastle University 
and is a fellow of the Institute of Directors, with over 25 years experience in the oil and gas 
industry, a career which has covered a number of senior management roles in upstream 
and downstream, in various regions of the world. Formerly at Atlantic Richfield (Arco) 
where Neil held positions of Construction Manager and Field Development Manager. 
 
Neil is a keen supporter of industry development, and is currently a member of the 
International Oil & Gas Business Advisory Board. During April 2006, Neil completed the 
three year Chairmanship of the Offshore Contractors Association, and was former member 
of the Step Change in Safety group, CRINE Industry initiatives and the Northern Offshore 
Federation. 
 
AMEC’s shares are traded on the London Stock Exchange where the company is listed in 
the Support Services sector. 


